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Foreword 

!This document (EN 13379:2001+A1:2013) has been prepared by Technical Committee CEN/TC 153 
"Machinery intended for use with foodstuffs and feed", the secretariat of which is held by DIN." 

This European Standard shall be given the status of a national standard, either by publication of an identical 
text or by endorsement, at the latest by July 2013, and conflicting national standards shall be withdrawn at the 
latest by July 2013. 

Attention is drawn to the possibility that some of the elements of this document may be the subject of patent 
rights. CEN [and/or CENELEC] shall not be held responsible for identifying any or all such patent rights. 

This document includes Amendment 1, approved by CEN on 2012-10-20. 

This document supersedes EN 13379:2001. 

The start and finish of text introduced or altered by amendment is indicated in the text by tags ! ". 

It is one of a series of safety standards for machines used in continuous pasta processing plants. 

!This document has been prepared under a mandate given to CEN by the European Commission and the 
European Free Trade Association, and supports essential requirements of EU Directive(s). 

For relationship with EU Directive(s), see informative Annex ZA which is an integral part of this standard." 

 !deleted text" 

According to the CEN/CENELEC Internal Regulations, the national standards organisations of the following 
countries are bound to implement this European Standard: Austria, Belgium, Bulgaria, Croatia, Cyprus, Czech 
Republic, Denmark, Estonia, Finland, Former Yugoslav Republic of Macedonia, France, Germany, Greece, 
Hungary, Iceland, Ireland, Italy, Latvia, Lithuania, Luxembourg, Malta, Netherlands, Norway, Poland, Portugal, 
Romania, Slovakia, Slovenia, Spain, Sweden, Switzerland, Turkey and the United Kingdom. 
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Introduction 

!This European Standard is a type C standard as stated in EN ISO 12100. 
 
The machinery concerned and the extent to which hazards, hazardous situations and hazardous events are 
covered are indicated in the scope of this document. 
 
When provisions of this type C standard are different from those which are stated in type A or B standards, the 
provisions of this type C standard take precedence over the provisions of the other standards, for machines 
that have been designed and built according to the provisions of this type C standard. 
 
Complementary to the hygiene requirements common to all food processing machines, specific requirements 
for cleanability and sanitation of the machines in the scope are formulated." 

1 Scope 

This European Standard applies to spreader, stripping and cutting machine, as well as the stick return 
conveyor and the stick magazine (see clause 3), used in continuous pasta processing plants able to produce 
more than 100 kg/h. 

This European standard specifies the safety requirements for the design, manufacture and information for 
safe use of spreader, stripping and cutting machine, as well as the stick return conveyor and the stick 
magazine classified as stationary units which cannot be moved when in operation. 

This European Standard does not apply to: 

 household machines, 

 semiautomatic machines, so called "batch machines" requiring manual loading. 

The significant hazards covered by this standard are listed in clause 4. 

These hazards and the measures for their reduction are described in the present European Standard. 

Ancillary equipment, which is not an integral part of the machinery (e.g. hoppers), is not covered by this 
European Standard. 

!This European Standard is not applicable to machines in its scope which are manufactured before the date 
of its publication as EN." 

2 Normative references 

!The following documents, in whole or in part, are normatively referenced in this document and are 
indispensable for its application. For dated references, only the edition cited applies. For undated references, 
the latest edition of the referenced document (including any amendments) applies." 

!EN 953:1997+A1:2009, Safety of machinery – Guards – General requirements for the design and 
construction of fixed and movable guards 
 
EN 982:1996+A1:2008, Safety of machinery – Safety requirements for fluid power systems and their 
components – Hydraulics 
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